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Far from being youths who have forgotten the community’s trust in them, 
these three young ladies from LASALLE College of the Arts are ensuring their 
work can benefit the public at large. Journalist Haryani Ismail spoke to these 
individuals who are part of The LASALLE Show Exhibition, a showcase of 
final year diploma and degree students’ projects, which will continue until 30 
May. 
 
Image: Society always in her mind. Muafah Amran designed a halfway house 
for ex-drug addicts that achieved a balance between private and communal 
space, thereby facilitating their rehabilitation back into society. 
 
Specially designed space helps ex-addicts 
 
Muafah Amran was attending school in Dubai and Saudi Arabia for the past 
10 years because her father, back then, was a project engineer for the Burj 
Khalifa in Dubai. However, four years ago, she returned to Singapore and 
embarked on a BA(Hons) Interior Design programme at LASALLE College of 
the Arts. The 24 year-old has nursed a life-long dream of creating a space 
that could be helpful to society.  
 
Therefore, in her final year at LASALLE, Muafah worked on designing a 
halfway house using Pertapis Halfway House as her model. The main aim of 
her project, Inverse, was to integrate ex-addicts back into the community 
through clever segmentation of spaces that allowed for various constructive 
activities.  
 
She explained: “Through in-depth research, I discovered that drug addiction 
usually stems from psychological factors, and not the actual drug itself. 
Currently, many halfway houses have their own daily schedules and 
regulations that residents have to adhere to. In this sense, there is not much 
freedom for an ex-addict, who is undergoing rehabilitation, to seek a private 
space for himself. My concept of ‘Me, Myself and I’ challenges this.” 
 
In her design, the provision of private spaces will enable ex-addicts to focus 
more on themselves. The presence of communal areas where they can 
mingle, such as dining and prayer rooms, also allows them to gently ease 
back into society. 
 
In a visit to Pertapis Halfway House, she found many empty spaces that could 
have been maximised as places for workshops where new skills could be 
learned. Such activities, she added, will help build the self-confidence of the 
residents. 
 
“Among my biggest challenges was when I had to contact and convince 
management at Pertapis about the value in my project. As a woman, it was 
indeed difficult to gain entry into an area that was completely over-run by 
men. After waiting patiently though, I was given permission to carry out 
interviews with officers at Pertapis, as well as to explore the environment 
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there. I looked at the arrangement of spaces and noted which were under-
uitilised so that they could be reconfigured to aid the process of ex-addicts 
reintegrating back into society,” Muafah shared. 
 
To Muafah, she regards society and citizens as the heartbeat of each of her 
design projects. 
 
In fact, she has won Silver in the Interior Design category at the Asia Young 
Designer Award 2017 that was organised by Nippon Paint. Her entry, 
Industrial Revolution, envisioned an area in King George’s Avenue as a 
recycling workshop for young designers to collaborate, turning old objects into 
new. The space also doubled up as a resource library. 
 
When asked about her win, she said, “The award is an encouragement for me 
to continue to reflect on social issues in each design project that I develop.” 
 
A collection of poetry from a mother, a child’s painting of a flower 
 
When she was offered the tutelage of seasoned artist Justin Lim under the 
National Arts Council’s (NAC) Community Arts Mentorship Programme, 
Amirah Raudhah Razali was grateful as it enabled her to work with special 
needs children. 
 
Amirah, 23 years-old, is a BA(Hons) Fine Arts student at LASALLE, and the 
youngest of three children in her family. She told Gah! that, “I have always 
wanted to work on such a project that directly assists those in need. I hope 
that the creative skills they learn can serve as a medium of therapy and 
communication with others.” 
 
Social issues and life are the main thrusts of her artworks, as exemplified by 
her final year project which showcases a floral display and poetry written by 
her mother. The work functions as a dialogue between Amirah and her 
mother, Fayzah Osman, about death. 
 
Amirah observed: “Not many people talk about death in their everyday 
conversations. Death is something that is feared or considered taboo, even 
among family members. However, my mother and I felt that this topic was 
important to discuss as it prepares us for what is inevitable because we never 
know when death might strike. I made this floral arrangement and sketch of 
her favourite flower to depict her handiwork as a wedding decorator. She, in 
turn, gifted me her poems as a bequest should she go first before me, and 
they describe what I can do to carry on in my life without her.” 
 
Amirah treasured her mother’s arrangement of lovely words and often used 
them as a foundation of her art pieces. 
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When asked about her future plans, she hopes to create more art that can 
help people. This vision of being a service to society stems in large part to her 
father, Mr Razali Subir, 57, who is a fire fighter. 
 
“Art is, by nature, refined. If I can touch people’s hearts and bring about a 
mindset change, I will be very happy. A piece of art can become a driving 
force for youths to approach the disabled community, while simultaneously 
empowering those less abled with valuable skills. Through art, we can deliver 
powerful messages about living life more meaningfully. In organising the 
programme for autistic children, some of my friends from other disciplines 
came to support and get more involved in community work,” said Amirah. 
 
Image: Learning about life through art. Amirah Raudhah Razali produced an 
artwork that was a dialogue, between her mother and herself, about death. 
 
Capturing the spirit of neighbourliness in Keat Hong 
 
Image: Dreaming of a friendly neighbourhood. Faleyana Zulkifli worked on a 
project that enabled her to get closer to her neighbours in Keat Hong. 
 
The story of harmonious neighbours in a kampong, rich with the spirit of 
cooperation, often touched Nur Faleyana Zulkifli. She pondered over why 
such a scene was so difficult to come by in Singapore’s public housing 
estates. The final year BA(Hons) Design Communication student therefore 
decided to create a project that inculcated curiosity about one’s fellow 
neighbours. 
 
This project has since enabled her family to get to know their neighbours of 
Keat Hong more intimately. This was accomplished by conducting interviews 
at common residential spaces, where neighbours they met had to fill up 
colourful forms that included brief details about themselves, their favourite 
activities and what they loved about the estate. 
 
The 22 year-old noted: “Many of us do not know our neighbours living in the 
same block, much less those living in nearby blocks, even though we often 
bump into them at the bus-stop or when we go to the shops. By conducting 
this random survey, I discovered that people were reluctant to talk to one 
another because they were either shy or too busy with their own careers such 
that they did not have time to chat or do activities together.” 
 
This petite girl, who used to be in the science stream at Jurong Junior 
College, has a penchant for producing work that is aimed at delving into social 
matters while getting members of society involved at the same time. 
 
She was glad that her whole family was ready to help her with this project, 
going out of their comfort zones to chat with neighbours they never knew 
before. Some were so comfortable that they soon became fast friends.  
 



Berita Harian, Pg 11, 22 May 2018 
Source: Berita Harian © Singapore Press Holdings Limited. Permission required for 
reproduction 
 

 Page 5 of 5 

Faleyana acknowledged that one of the main challenges she faced was the 
uncertainty on the part of the residents to answer questions because they 
were unsure where their responses would be channeled. However, she 
assured them that each photograph and response collected would be 
documented only for the reference of the residents and the neighbours around 
them. 
 
“I used my background in scientific inquiry to conduct research in this design 
course. Even though I am lacking on the drawing front, I have encouraged 
myself to contribute back to society after receiving scholarships from groups 
like Mendaki. My hope, after completing my studies at LASALLE, is to be able 
to work in a creative design firm that prioritises the social rights of individuals,” 
she shared. 


